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What is good care? In this innovative and compelling book, Annemarie Mol argues that good care has little
to do with 'patient choice' and, therefore, creating more opportunities for patient choice will not improve
health care.

Although it is possible to treat people who seek professional help as customers or citizens, Mol argues that
this undermines ways of thinking and acting crucial to health care. Illustrating the discussion with examples
from diabetes clinics and diabetes self care, the book presents the 'logic of care' in a step by step contrast
with the 'logic of choice'. She concludes that good care is not a matter of making well argued individual
choices but is something that grows out of collaborative and continuing attempts to attune knowledge and
technologies to diseased bodies and complex lives.

Mol does not criticise the practices she encountered in her field work as messy or ad hoc, but makes explicit
what it is that motivates them: an intriguing combination of adaptability and perseverance. The Logic of
Care: Health and the problem of patient choice is crucial reading for all those interested in the theory and
practice of care, including sociologists, anthropologists and health care professionals. It will also speak to
policymakers and become a valuable source of inspiration for patient activists.
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From reader reviews:

Scott Barbour:

As people who live in the particular modest era should be change about what going on or info even
knowledge to make them keep up with the era and that is always change and move ahead. Some of you
maybe will certainly update themselves by studying books. It is a good choice for you but the problems
coming to you is you don't know what kind you should start with. This The Logic of Care: Health and the
Problem of Patient Choice is our recommendation to help you keep up with the world. Why, as this book
serves what you want and want in this era.

Andrew Meadows:

The book untitled The Logic of Care: Health and the Problem of Patient Choice is the book that
recommended to you to see. You can see the quality of the book content that will be shown to you actually.
The language that author use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The article writer was did a lot
of research when write the book, to ensure the information that they share for your requirements is absolutely
accurate. You also will get the e-book of The Logic of Care: Health and the Problem of Patient Choice from
the publisher to make you a lot more enjoy free time.

Shawn Marsh:

Beside this specific The Logic of Care: Health and the Problem of Patient Choice in your phone, it can give
you a way to get nearer to the new knowledge or details. The information and the knowledge you may got
here is fresh from oven so don't end up being worry if you feel like an aged people live in narrow
community. It is good thing to have The Logic of Care: Health and the Problem of Patient Choice because
this book offers to your account readable information. Do you at times have book but you seldom get what
it's exactly about. Oh come on, that won't happen if you have this in the hand. The Enjoyable blend here
cannot be questionable, just like treasuring beautiful island. Use you still want to miss it? Find this book in
addition to read it from currently!

Charles Holland:

A lot of book has printed but it is different. You can get it by net on social media. You can choose the very
best book for you, science, comedy, novel, or whatever simply by searching from it. It is known as of book
The Logic of Care: Health and the Problem of Patient Choice. Contain your knowledge by it. Without
leaving behind the printed book, it could possibly add your knowledge and make you actually happier to
read. It is most important that, you must aware about reserve. It can bring you from one spot to other place.
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