
Pro Vim
Mark McDonnell

Click here if your download doesn"t start automatically

http://bookengine.site/go/read.php?id=B00MY0JHY4
http://bookengine.site/go/read.php?id=B00MY0JHY4
http://bookengine.site/go/read.php?id=B00MY0JHY4


Pro Vim

Mark McDonnell

Pro Vim Mark McDonnell

Pro Vim teaches you the real-world workflows, tips, and tricks of this powerful, terminal-based text editor.
This book covers all the essentials, as well as lesser-known but equally powerful features that will ensure
you become a top-level performant and professional user, able to jump between multiple sessions while
manipulating and controlling with ease many different documents and programming files. With easy-to-
digest chapters on all the areas you need to learn, this book is a key addition to your library that will enable
you to become a fast, efficient user of Vim.

Using this book, you will learn how to properly configure your terminal environment and work without even
touching the mouse. You will become an expert in how Vim actually works: how buffers and sessions work,
automation through Macros and shell scripting, real-world workflows, and how to work efficiently and fast
with plugins and different themes. You will also learn practical, real-world tips on how to best utilize Vim
alongside the terminal multiplexer tmux; helping you to manage files across multiple servers and terminal
sessions. Avoid common pitfalls and work with best practice ways to efficiently edit and control your files
and sessions from the terminal interface.

Vim is an advanced power tool that is commonly recognized as being difficult to learn, even for experienced
developers. This book shows you how to become an expert by focusing on not only the fundamentals of how
Vim works, but also by distilling the author's own experiences learning Vim into an easy-to-understand and
follow guide. It's time to bring your programming, editing, and workflow skills up to the professional level -
use Pro Vim today.

What you’ll learn

• Understand the fundamentals of how Vim works so you can better utilize its features.

• Extend Vim using plugins; along with specific plugins that cover a wide range of technical requirements.

• Automate Vim and tmux via the use of Macros and Scripting.

• Learn how to make complex pattern based changes across multiple Vim buffers at once.

• Pair program with remote users connecting to a single local tmux session.

• Learn real-world workflows that integrate both Vim and tmux together.

Who this book is for

Pro Vim is for any developer who wishes (or has tried in the past and failed) to understand how to leverage



the tools provided by Vim and tmux and integrate them into their professional working environment.
Allowing them to take advantage of the power features these applications provide to become a better
programmer.
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From reader reviews:

Anna Maples:

Do you have favorite book? When you have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important
thing for us to be aware of everything in the world. Each reserve has different aim or maybe goal; it means
that guide has different type. Some people really feel enjoy to spend their time to read a book. They are
really reading whatever they take because their hobby is actually reading a book. Consider the person who
don't like examining a book? Sometime, individual feel need book once they found difficult problem or
exercise. Well, probably you will need this Pro Vim.

Amber Weitz:

Beside this Pro Vim in your phone, it might give you a way to get more close to the new knowledge or facts.
The information and the knowledge you can got here is fresh from your oven so don't always be worry if you
feel like an previous people live in narrow community. It is good thing to have Pro Vim because this book
offers for you readable information. Do you at times have book but you would not get what it's facts
concerning. Oh come on, that will not end up to happen if you have this in your hand. The Enjoyable option
here cannot be questionable, including treasuring beautiful island. Use you still want to miss it? Find this
book as well as read it from today!

Sunny Weaver:

Don't be worry should you be afraid that this book will probably filled the space in your house, you will get
it in e-book way, more simple and reachable. This kind of Pro Vim can give you a lot of pals because by you
taking a look at this one book you have matter that they don't and make you more like an interesting person.
This specific book can be one of one step for you to get success. This reserve offer you information that
maybe your friend doesn't know, by knowing more than some other make you to be great men and women.
So , why hesitate? Let's have Pro Vim.

Tiffany Reyes:

That reserve can make you to feel relax. That book Pro Vim was colorful and of course has pictures around.
As we know that book Pro Vim has many kinds or category. Start from kids until adolescents. For example
Naruto or Investigation company Conan you can read and think you are the character on there. Therefore ,
not at all of book are usually make you bored, any it can make you feel happy, fun and chill out. Try to
choose the best book in your case and try to like reading this.
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