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The image of the shadow in mid-twentieth-century America appeared across a variety of genres and media
including poetry, pulp fiction, photography, and film. Drawing on an extensive framework that ranges from
Cold War cultural histories to theorizations of psychoanalysis and the Gothic, Erik Mortenson argues that
shadow imagery in 1950s and 1960s American culture not only reflected the anxiety and ambiguity of the
times but also offered an imaginative space for artists to challenge the binary rhetoric associated with the
Cold War.

 

After contextualizing the postwar use of shadow imagery in the wake of the atomic bomb, Ambiguous
Borderlands looks at shadows in print works, detailing the reemergence of the pulp fiction crime fighter the
Shadow in the late-1950s writings of Sylvia Plath, Amiri Baraka, and Jack Kerouac. Using Freudian and
Jungian conceptions of the unconscious, Mortenson then discusses Kerouac’s and Allen Ginsberg’s shared
dream of a “shrouded stranger” and how it shaped their Beat aesthetic. Turning to the visual, Mortenson
examines the dehumanizing effect of shadow imagery in the Cold War photography of Robert Frank,
William Klein, and Ralph Eugene Meatyard.  Mortenson concludes with an investigation of the use of
chiaroscuro in 1950s film noir and the popular television series The Twilight Zone, further detailing how the
complexities of Cold War society were mirrored across these media in the ubiquitous imagery of light and
dark.

 

From comics to movies, Beats to bombs, Ambiguous Borderlands provides a novel understanding of the
Cold War cultural context through its analysis of the image of the shadow in midcentury media. Its
interdisciplinary approach, ambitious subject matter, and diverse theoretical framing make it essential
reading for anyone interested in American literary and popular culture during the fifties and sixties.
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From reader reviews:

Latasha Sutterfield:

The book Ambiguous Borderlands: Shadow Imagery in Cold War American Culture gives you the sense of
being enjoy for your spare time. You should use to make your capable considerably more increase. Book can
to be your best friend when you getting tension or having big problem with the subject. If you can make
looking at a book Ambiguous Borderlands: Shadow Imagery in Cold War American Culture for being your
habit, you can get more advantages, like add your personal capable, increase your knowledge about a few or
all subjects. You could know everything if you like open up and read a publication Ambiguous Borderlands:
Shadow Imagery in Cold War American Culture. Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science
publication or encyclopedia or other people. So , how do you think about this reserve?

Dean Rakestraw:

The book Ambiguous Borderlands: Shadow Imagery in Cold War American Culture can give more
knowledge and information about everything you want. Why then must we leave the great thing like a book
Ambiguous Borderlands: Shadow Imagery in Cold War American Culture? A few of you have a different
opinion about guide. But one aim that will book can give many information for us. It is absolutely suitable.
Right now, try to closer using your book. Knowledge or info that you take for that, you are able to give for
each other; you can share all of these. Book Ambiguous Borderlands: Shadow Imagery in Cold War
American Culture has simple shape but the truth is know: it has great and big function for you. You can seem
the enormous world by available and read a e-book. So it is very wonderful.

Michael Clark:

In this era globalization it is important to someone to get information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information
simpler to share. You can find a lot of references to get information example: internet, magazine, book, and
soon. You can observe that now, a lot of publisher which print many kinds of book. The book that
recommended for your requirements is Ambiguous Borderlands: Shadow Imagery in Cold War American
Culture this publication consist a lot of the information on the condition of this world now. This particular
book was represented how do the world has grown up. The vocabulary styles that writer use for explain it is
easy to understand. The writer made some exploration when he makes this book. That's why this book ideal
all of you.

Lowell Bohler:

What is your hobby? Have you heard which question when you got pupils? We believe that that question
was given by teacher with their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everybody has different hobby. And also
you know that little person similar to reading or as studying become their hobby. You need to know that
reading is very important in addition to book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to add you



knowledge, except your current teacher or lecturer. You see good news or update about something by book.
Amount types of books that can you decide to try be your object. One of them is niagra Ambiguous
Borderlands: Shadow Imagery in Cold War American Culture.
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