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Stone's life is one of ordered control. As a child he was experimented on and turned into something more
than human. Now the leader of The Brotherhood, an elite group of soldier assassins, he is given the task of
eradicating the man who possibly holds the key to his freedom. When Dr Wesley Folcomb finds himself
targeted by the government group that killed his father, he is forced to seek safety from the very assassin sent
to eliminate him. On the run for their lives, Wesley and Stone grow close but with such different pasts, can
they find love? Or will the danger hunting them cause their relationship to crumble before it has a chance to
become as solid as stone?
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From reader reviews:

Nancy Sanchez:

The book Solid as Stone (the Brotherhood #1) make one feel enjoy for your spare time. You can use to make
your capable far more increase. Book can to be your best friend when you getting stress or having big
problem with the subject. If you can make studying a book Solid as Stone (the Brotherhood #1) to become
your habit, you can get much more advantages, like add your current capable, increase your knowledge about
some or all subjects. It is possible to know everything if you like open and read a guide Solid as Stone (the
Brotherhood #1). Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science book or encyclopedia or other people. So ,
how do you think about this publication?

Stanley Wells:

Reading a book can be one of a lot of exercise that everyone in the world really likes. Do you like reading
book therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a book will give you a lot of
new facts. When you read a book you will get new information due to the fact book is one of various ways to
share the information or even their idea. Second, reading a book will make you actually more imaginative.
When you studying a book especially fictional works book the author will bring someone to imagine the
story how the character types do it anything. Third, you are able to share your knowledge to others. When
you read this Solid as Stone (the Brotherhood #1), you may tells your family, friends and soon about yours
guide. Your knowledge can inspire different ones, make them reading a reserve.

Gary Lafountain:

This Solid as Stone (the Brotherhood #1) is great reserve for you because the content and that is full of
information for you who always deal with world and have to make decision every minute. This specific book
reveal it data accurately using great organize word or we can point out no rambling sentences inside. So if
you are read it hurriedly you can have whole info in it. Doesn't mean it only offers you straight forward
sentences but tricky core information with wonderful delivering sentences. Having Solid as Stone (the
Brotherhood #1) in your hand like finding the world in your arm, information in it is not ridiculous 1. We
can say that no publication that offer you world with ten or fifteen minute right but this e-book already do
that. So , this really is good reading book. Hello Mr. and Mrs. hectic do you still doubt this?

Joseph Whitely:

With this era which is the greater man or who has ability to do something more are more valuable than other.
Do you want to become considered one of it? It is just simple solution to have that. What you should do is
just spending your time little but quite enough to experience a look at some books. Among the books in the
top list in your reading list is actually Solid as Stone (the Brotherhood #1). This book that is qualified as The
Hungry Mountains can get you closer in becoming precious person. By looking upwards and review this
reserve you can get many advantages.
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